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Detroit Police Homicide Detective, Sergeant Roman Stefan has one of the best arrest records on the force-
he's also a dirty cop. Roman promises his ailing father that he will clean up his life and go straight. The
problem is, Roman likes being dirty. As he deals with his promise, he is assigned to a 4-month old homicide
investigation of a prostitute that no one is interested in. Compounding his trouble is the dead hooker's sister,
Channel 3 News anchor Hallie Warner, who has placed pressure on the mayor's office to provide answers.
As Roman and Hallie find clues of Ebony Warner's murder, they soon become targets of two ruthless killers
who don't want the truth to be uncovered. In mortal danger and unable to rely on his dirty ways; will Roman
Stefan be able to keep the promise he made to his father?
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Howard:

The book The Promise can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything
you want. Why then must we leave the great thing like a book The Promise? A number of you have a
different opinion about book. But one aim that book can give many information for us. It is absolutely
correct. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you may
give for each other; you can share all of these. Book The Promise has simple shape nevertheless, you know:
it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by open and read a book. So it is
very wonderful.

Jacqueline Harding:

The publication untitled The Promise is the book that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality
of the reserve content that will be shown to you actually. The language that publisher use to explained their
ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book, therefore
the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of The
Promise from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Frank Botelho:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this The Promise e-book written by well-known
writer who knows well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written
in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then
you still uncertainty The Promise as good book not just by the cover but also by the content. This is one book
that can break don't determine book by its handle, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this
specific!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to yet another
sixth sense.

Clyde King:

As a student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or even
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's spirit or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this time
there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and can't
see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know
that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. Therefore this The Promise can make you feel more interested to read.
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